

HUNT COUNTY
 BID AWARD
 FORMAL BID #223-22, ROAD OIL and SEAL COAT EMULSIONS
 Effective 4/23/22 through 4/22/23

17,380

FILED FOR RECORD
 at 12:30 o'clock

APR 12 2022

VENDOR	Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil, LTD	Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil, LTD	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC	P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC
PRODUCT	PRICE per Ton Delivered to all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Picked Up for all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Delivered to all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Picked Up for all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Delivered to all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Picked Up for all Precincts
Road Oil	\$651.00	\$625.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pick-up Point		8621 FM 2276 N, Henderson, TX				
Proof of Insurance	Yes		Yes		Yes	
VENDOR	Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil, LTD	Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil, LTD	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC	P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC
PRODUCT	PRICE per Gallon Delivered	PRICE per Gallon Picked Up	PRICE per Gallon Delivered	PRICE per Gallon Picked Up	PRICE per Gallon Delivered	PRICE per Gallon Picked Up
CRS-1P, Pct 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-1P, Pct 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-1P, Pct 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-1P, Pct 4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pick Up Point			4648 Western Way, Temple TX 76504		No Bid	
CRS-2P, Pct. 1	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.5900	\$3.40	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2P, Pct. 2	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.5900	\$3.40	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2P, Pct. 3	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.5900	\$3.40	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2P, Pct. 4	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.5900	\$3.40	No Bid	No Bid

By BECKY LANDRUM
 County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.
 Page 3 of 3

HUNT COUNTY
 BID AWARD
 FORMAL BID #223-22, ROAD OIL and SEAL COAT EMULSIONS
 Effective 4/23/22 through 4/22/23

VENDOR	Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil, LTD	Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil, LTD	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC	P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC
PRODUCT	PRICE per Ton Delivered to all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Picked Up for all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Delivered to all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Picked Up for all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Delivered to all Precincts	PRICE per Ton Picked Up for all Precincts
CRS-2/2H, Pct. 1	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.1900	\$3.00	\$2.99 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)	\$2.74 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)
CRS-2/2H, Pct. 2	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.1900	\$3.00	\$2.99 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)	\$2.74 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)
CRS-2/2H, Pct. 3	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.1900	\$3.00	\$2.99 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)	\$2.74 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)
CRS-2/2H, Pct. 4	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.1900	\$3.00	\$2.99 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)	\$2.74 (CWE-2 equivalent & superior)
CSS-1, Pct. 1	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.0700	\$3.05	\$2.69 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)	\$2.44 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)
CSS-1, Pct. 2	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.0700	\$3.05	\$2.69 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)	\$2.44 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)
CSS-1, Pct. 3	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.0700	\$3.05	\$2.69 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)	\$2.44 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)
CSS-1, Pct. 4	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.0700	\$3.05	\$2.69 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)	\$2.44 (P2 Stabilizer - superior)
AE-P, Pct. 1	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.7000	\$3.50	\$2.04 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)	\$1.79 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)
AE-P, Pct. 2	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.7000	\$3.50	\$2.04 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)	\$1.79 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)
AE-P, Pct. 3	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.7000	\$3.50	\$2.04 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)	\$1.79 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)
AE-P, Pct. 4	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.7000	\$3.50	\$2.04 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)	\$1.79 (Lucky 7 Primer - equivalent)
Pick Up Point	600 Minton Road, Saginaw, TX 76179					
Envirotac II, Pct. 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Envirotac II, Pct. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Envirotac II, Pct. 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Envirotac II, Pct. 4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pick Up Point	516 S. McLennan, Elm Mott, TX 76640					

HUNT COUNTY
BID AWARD
FORMAL BID #223-22, ROAD OIL and SEAL COAT EMULSIONS
Effective 4/23/22 through 4/22/23

Ergon- Adds Federal Env Fee \$0.49770/ton for asphalt & polymers \$0.00150 gallon for emulsions loads

Ergon - Demurrage rate is \$90.00 per hour after 2 hours. Pump & Hose chg \$ 90.00 per load

Ergon - Freight is based on full transport load, even if full load of material is not ordered. Full Transport Loads of 5,500 gallons

Ergon - For less than full loads, freight would be \$1,045/load from Mt. Pleasant and \$1,100/load from Saginaw

Ergon - For equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to \$400.00

Ergon- Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff

Ergon - For AE-P: 600 Minton Road, Saginaw, TX 76179

Ergon - For All Other Materials the pickup point is: 209 Robert Nance Road, Mount Pleasant, TX 75455

Ergon - Allow 24 hours after order is placed for delivery

Ergon - Is willing to allow other Government Entities to piggyback off this contract, if awarded, under the same terms and conditions.

P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC - Partial Loads a dds .25 per gallon (under 5K load not ordered)

P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC - Demurrage rate is \$80.00 per hour after 2 hours

P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC - Pump and Hose = \$80.00

P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC - Canceled or returned loads subject to additional freight charges

P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC - Is willing to allow other Government Entities to piggyback off this contract, if awarded, under the same terms and conditions.

P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC - Sole-Source Affidavit for the following items: P2 Stabilizer, P2 Rejuvenator, ROC, CWE-2, CWP and all P2 Road Primes

Bryan & Bryan Asphalt- No additional charge for partial loads of road oil

Bryan & Bryan Asphalt- Is willing to allow other Government Entities to piggyback off this contract, if awarded, under the same terms and conditions.

Bryan & Bryan Asphalt - Demurrage rate: 0

The Purchasing Department recommends award of this bid to all bidders in accordance with Local Government Code §262.027€